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	Department of Administration

Purchasing Division

608/266-4131

www.danepurchasing.com
	SUMMARY OF 

REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL


The firms listed below submitted proposals for the County’s consideration. No other information is available while proposals are under review . It is the County’s policy not to disclose any information about the proposals submitted until a contract has been fully executed, passed by the County Board and signed by the County Executive.

	Page 1 of 4  

	RFP Proposal No.
	109108
	Awarded to :
	

	Opening Date
	October 19, 2009 2pm
	Date of Award:
	

	Subject:
	Tables 
	Comments:
	

	Department:
	Alliant Energy Center
	
	

	VENDOR NAME:

CITY, STATE:
	Cubicles.com

New York, NY
	The Buckstaff Company

Oshkosh, WI
	DLT Sales, Inc.

Rolling Meadows, IL
	Kavanaugh Restaurant Supply Inc.

Madison, WI
	Affordable Office Interiors

Madison, WI

	Vendor Registration
	Paid
	Paid
	
	Paid
	Paid

	
	
	
	
	
	

	200 ea. 18” x 96” x 29” folding 

             classroom tables
	$111.00 each

$22,200.00 total
	$453.90 each

$90,780.76 total
	$130.49 each

$26,098.00 total
	$128.00 each

$25,600.00 total
	$123.70 each

$24,740.00 total

	24 ea. Cocktail tables


	$335.00 each

$8,040.00
	$438.01 each

$10,512.21 total
	$158.52 each

$3,804.48 total
	$240.00 each

$5,760.00 total
	$222.06 each

$5,329.44 total

	2 ea. Carts for cocktail tables


	$229.50 each

$459.00 total
	$149.24 each

$298.47 total
	$280.87 each

$561.74 total
	$410.00 each

$820.00 total
	$376.87 each

$753.47 total

	GRAND TOTAL
	$30,699.00
	$101,591.44
	$30,464.22
	$32,180.00
	$30,823.18

	Acknowledged Addendum?
	No, emailed
	Yes
	No, emailed
	Yes
	Yes

	
	
	
	
	
	

	Delivery ARO
	21-30 days
	8-10 weeks
	3-4 weeks
	6-8 weeks
	4-5 weeks


	[image: image2.png]



	Department of Administration

Purchasing Division

608/266-4131

www.danepurchasing.com
	SUMMARY OF 

REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL


The firms listed below submitted proposals for the County’s consideration. No other information is available while proposals are under review . It is the County’s policy not to disclose any information about the proposals submitted until a contract has been fully executed, passed by the County Board and signed by the County Executive.

	Page 2 of 4  

	RFP Proposal No.
	109108
	Awarded to :
	

	Opening Date
	October 19, 2009 2pm
	Date of Award:
	

	Subject:
	Tables 
	Comments:
	

	Department:
	Alliant Energy Center
	
	

	VENDOR NAME:

CITY, STATE:
	Alfax Furniture

Dallas, TX
	Lerdahl Business Interiors

Middleton, WI
	ATD-American Co.

Wyncote, PA
	Virco Inc.

Conway, AR
	LeDoux Industries Inc.

Orange, CA

	Vendor Registration
	Paid
	Paid
	Paid
	Paid
	Paid

	
	
	
	
	
	

	200 ea. 18” x 96” x 29” folding 

             classroom tables
	$105.92 each

$21,184.00 total
	$110.65 each

$22,130.00 total
	$83.81 each

$16,762.00 total
	$80.28 each

$16,056.00 total
	$102.58 each

$20,516.00 total

	24 ea. Cocktail tables


	$229.52 each

$5,508.48 total
	$202.55 each

$4,861.20 total
	$146.18 each

$3,508.32 total
	No bid
	$120.58 each

$2,893.92 total

	2 ea. Carts for cocktail tables


	$946.85 each

$1,893.70 total
	$347.15 each

$694.30 total
	$220.71 each

$441.42 total
	No bid
	$380.00 each

$760.00 total

	GRAND TOTAL
	$28,586.18
	$27,685.50
	$20,711.74
	$16,056.00
	$1,100.00 freight

$25,269.92

	Acknowledged Addendum?
	Yes
	No, emailed
	Yes
	Yes.
	Yes

	
	
	
	
	
	

	Delivery ARO
	4 weeks
	4 weeks
	35-45 days
	10-45 days
	4 weeks
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	Department of Administration

Purchasing Division

608/266-4131

www.danepurchasing.com
	SUMMARY OF 

REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL


The firms listed below submitted proposals for the County’s consideration. No other information is available while proposals are under review . It is the County’s policy not to disclose any information about the proposals submitted until a contract has been fully executed, passed by the County Board and signed by the County Executive.

	Page 3 of 4 

	RFP Proposal No.
	109108
	Awarded to :
	

	Opening Date
	October 19, 2009 2pm
	Date of Award:
	

	Subject:
	Tables 
	Comments:
	

	Department:
	Alliant Energy Center
	
	

	VENDOR NAME:

CITY, STATE:
	Palmer Snyder Furniture

Lexington, KY
	Krueger International

Green Bay, WI
	Building Service Inc.

Milwaukee, WI
	School Specialty

Mansfield, OH
	Emmons Business Interiors

Madison, WI

	Vendor Registration
	Paid
	Paid
	Paid
	Paid
	Paid

	
	
	
	
	
	

	200 ea. 18” x 96” x 29” folding 

             classroom tables
	$160.00 each

$32,000.00 total
	$123.98 each

$24,796.00 total
	$445.69 each

$89,138.00 total
	$123.49 each

$24,698.00 total
	$118.20 each

$23,640.00 total

	24 ea. Cocktail tables


	$180.00 each

$4,320.00 total
	$147.06 each

$3,529.44 total
	No bid
	$190.17 each

$4,564.08 total
	$216.56 each

$5,197.44 total

	2 ea. Carts for cocktail tables


	$500.00 each

$1,000 total
	$179.55 each

$359.10 total
	No bid
	$351.96 each

$703.92 total
	$371.37 each

$742.74 total

	GRAND TOTAL
	$37,320.00
	$28,684.54
	$89,138.00
	$29,966.00
	$29,580.18

	Acknowledged Addendum?
	Yes
	Yes.
	Yes
	Yes
	Yes

	
	
	
	
	
	

	Delivery ARO
	30 days
	21-21 days
	3-4 weeks
	2-4 weeks
	5 weeks
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	Department of Administration

Purchasing Division

608/266-4131

www.danepurchasing.com
	SUMMARY OF 

REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL


The firms listed below submitted proposals for the County’s consideration. No other information is available while proposals are under review . It is the County’s policy not to disclose any information about the proposals submitted until a contract has been fully executed, passed by the County Board and signed by the County Executive.

	Page 4 of 4  

	RFP Proposal No.
	109108
	Awarded to :
	

	Opening Date
	October 19, 2009 2pm
	Date of Award:
	

	Subject:
	Tables 
	Comments:
	

	Department:
	Alliant Energy Center
	
	

	VENDOR NAME:

CITY, STATE:
	CJ& Associates

New Berlin, WI
	
	
	
	

	Vendor Registration
	Paid
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	

	200 ea. 18” x 96” x 29” folding 

             classroom tables
	$83.00 each

$16,600.00 total
	
	
	
	

	24 ea. Cocktail tables


	No bid
	
	
	
	

	2 ea. Carts for cocktail tables


	No bid
	
	
	
	

	GRAND TOTAL
	$16,600.00
	
	
	
	

	Acknowledged Addendum?
	Yes
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	

	Delivery ARO
	2-3 weeks
	
	
	
	


