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	Department of Administration

Purchasing Division

608/266- 4131

www.danepurchasing.com
	BID

SUMMARY


The firms listed below submitted bids for the County’s consideration. Bids are subject to review by the respective County officials.

	Page 1 of 2  

	Bid No.
	110068
	Awarded to :
	

	Opening Date
	7/14/2010, 2pm
	Date of Award:
	

	Subject:
	Body Armor
	Comments:
	

	Department:
	Sheriff’s Office
	
	

	VENDOR NAME:

CITY , STATE:
	5 Alarm Fire & Safety Equipment LLC

Delafield, WI 
	Force One LLC

Fairfield, OH
	Galls, Aramark Company LLC

Lexington, KY
	Protective Products Enterprises Inc.

Sunrise, FL
	Ray O’Herron Co., Inc.

Danville, IL

	Vendor Registration?
	PAID
	PAID
	PAID
	PAID
	PAID

	Male Vest, max. 1.18 lbs/sq. ft.


	No bid
	$356.00

ForceOne, LLC ASL2

Gender neutral
	$300

Galls BP433

10% oversize fee for 2x and above
	$349.00

Python LX II
	$410.00

Armor Express QTM-B-II

	Female Vest, max. 1.18 lbs/sq. ft.


	No bid
	$356.00

ForceOne, LLC ASL2

Gender neutral
	$300

Galls BP433

10% oversize fee for 2x and above
	$349.00

Python LX II
	$410.00

Armor Express QTMF-B-II

	Male Vest, max. 0.89 lbs/sq. ft.


	$692.42

Bravo LVL II KNX
	No bid
	$450

Galls BP451

10% oversize fee for 2x and above
	$539.00

Python DX II
	No bid

	Female Vest, max. 0.89 lbs/sq. ft.


	$692.42

Bravo LVL II KNX
	No bid
	$450

Galls BP451

10% oversize fee for 2x and above
	$539.00

Python DX II
	No bid

	Optional Price for Second Trauma Plate
	$40.00
	$25.00
	$25.00
	$29.00
	$39.00

	Optional price for Level IIIA upgrade from .89 lbs./sq.ft. vest, max 1.15 lbs./sq. ft. per specifications
	$808.61
	$405.00
	$60.00
	$619.00

Python GX IIIZ
	No bid

	Percentage discount - vest
	30%
	50%
	15%
	0%
	

	Percentage discount – accessories
	20%
	50%
	10%
	55%
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	Bid No.
	110068
	Awarded to :
	

	Opening Date
	7/14/2010, 2pm
	Date of Award:
	

	Subject:
	Body Armor
	Comments:
	

	Department:
	Sheriff’s Office
	
	

	VENDOR NAME:

CITY , STATE:
	Ray O’Herron Co Inc.

Danville, IL
	Streicher’s

Butler, WI
	
	
	

	Vendor Registration?
	PAID
	PAID
	
	
	

	Male Vest, max. 1.0 lbs/sq. ft.


	$299.00

Point Blank CII
	$485.00

ABA/Xtreme XT01
	
	
	

	Female Vest, max. 1.0 lbs/sq. ft.


	$299.00

Point Blank CIIF
	$485.00

ABA/Xtreme XT01
	
	
	

	Male Vest, max. 0.8 lbs/sq. ft.


	$479.00

Point Blank Hi-Lite BII
	No bid
	
	
	

	Female Vest, max. 0.8 lbs/sq. ft.


	$479.00 

Point Blank Hi-Lite BIIF
	No bid
	
	
	

	Optional Price for Second Trauma Plate
	$19.00
	$30.00
	
	
	

	Optional price for Level IIIA upgrade from .89 lbs./sq.ft. vest, max 1.15 lbs./sq. ft. per specifications
	No bid
	$590.00
	
	
	

	Percentage discount - vest
	
	48%
	
	
	

	Percentage discount – accessories
	
	40%
	
	
	


